WBCIR:21346
Freedom of Information request relating to common driving and parking fines. I am requesting the following information held by your authority for the periods:
• 1 January to 31 December 2024
•1 January to 31 December 2025
Please provide a breakdown of the data for each council area or enforcement district within your authority’s jurisdiction, where applicable.

1. Total driving and parking fines
The total number of driving and parking fines issued during each period, along with the month in each period that recorded the highest number of fines.
	Authority-wide Monthly Totals (Jan–Dec)
	2024
	2025
	Combined Total

	Jan
	2614
	2036
	4650

	Feb
	2278
	1916
	4194

	Mar
	2394
	2263
	4657

	Apr
	2584
	2551
	5135

	May
	2371
	2514
	4885

	Jun
	2442
	2271
	4713

	Jul
	2443
	2300
	4743

	Aug
	2051
	2227
	4278

	Sep
	2148
	2600
	4748

	Oct
	2229
	2753
	4982

	Nov
	2414
	2661
	5075

	Dec
	2368
	2577
	4945

	Totals 
	28336
	28669
	57005



2. Types of fines issued
A breakdown of fines issued by type during each period, including where applicable:
• Parking offences (e.g. no valid ticket, overstaying, double yellow lines)
• Obstructive parking offences (including dropped kerbs)
• Bus lane offences
• Yellow box junction offences
• Red route offences
• Moving traffic offences (e.g. banned turns, no entry violations)
Please include the total number issued for each fine type and indicate which fine type was most common in each period.
	Authority-wide Fine Type Mix (PCNs per year)
	2024
	2025
	Combined Total

	Moving traffic Contraventions 
	6038
	3961
	9999

	Obstructive parking Contraventions
	369
	431
	800

	Parking Contraventions 
	21009
	23326
	44335

	Bus gate Contraventions 
	79
	44
	123

	Yellow box junction Contraventions 
	841
	907
	1748

	Totals 
	28336
	28669
	57005



3. Age groups
Where data is held, the number of fines issued during each period to drivers in the following age groups: Data not held 
• Under 25 years old
• 25–64 years old
• 65 years old and over 

4. Gender
Where data is held, the number of fines issued during each period, broken down by gender. Data not held 

5. Repeat fines
Where available, the number of individuals who received more than one driving or parking fine within the same period. 7,397 repeat offenders who have received 2 or more PCN’s 

6. Seasonal trends
Monthly totals for driving and parking fines during each period, to identify any seasonal patterns.
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